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There is no more refined ritual than that of tea drinking in Asia. In Tea in the East, Carole Manchester,
author of French Tea, invites you on a journey to the earliest tea-producing countries -- China, Japan, India,
Sri Lanka -- to savor the pleasures of the ancient brew.

Lavishly illustrated with beautiful full-color photographs of tea ceremonies and their exotic settings, Tea in
the East evokes the tranquillity and unique pleasures of the Eastern tea. In China, aged tea leaves are steeped
for seconds in a tiny clay pot and poured into doll-sized handleless cups, the earthy taste savored as if it were
a rare wine. In a still, silent room in Kyoto, powdered green tea is reverently whisked in a ceramic bowl in
preparation for the tea ceremony. On the lawn of a planters' club in India, tea is served in cups covered with
tiny beaded doilies to keep the tea free from dust.

Eastern tea ceremonies embody a rare grace in both their gentle choreography and in the decorative and
functional beauty of the tea service. In China, the fashion of drinking tea inspired the craftsmanship of
exquisite porcelain and ceramic teaware. In Japan, artisans create starkly simple teabowls, whisks, lacquer
trays, and boxes. The teas of India are served in teacups made of silver.

As delicate and elegant as the utensils of the Eastern tea ceremony itself are their sweet and savory
accompaniments. Dim sum, tiny stuffed delicacies, are served with a Cantonese tea; a bitter Japanese tea is
balanced by seasonal bean curd sweets; Indians serve hot and spicy pastries with milky, sugary tea; and Sri
Lankans drink their tea with crepe-like pastries called hoppers. Together with the story of tea in the East,
you'll find recipes for tempting and unusual tea accompaniments, including a savory Green Tea-Marinated
Chicken Sandwich, Marbled Tea Eggs, and the Russian Tea Room Spice Cake.

The varieties of Asian teas are as distinctive as their traditions. Using Tea in the East as a guide, you can
explore the many satisfying tastes and aromas: the flowery Pai Mu Tan, a rare mix of two white tea plants
from China; Japan's finest green tea, Gyokuro; Genmaicha, which is mixed with roasted rice that gives it a
popcorn flavor; Darjeelings and robust Assam teas of India: and the exquisite afternoon teas of Ceylon. Also
included are recipes for iced teas and tea remedies, as well as suggestions for the many practical uses of tea,
storage methods, and a buyer's source guide.
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From reader reviews:

Lucille Renner:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important normally. The book Tea in the East: Tea Habits Along the Tea Route ended up
being making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is quite
advantages for you. The book Tea in the East: Tea Habits Along the Tea Route is not only giving you
considerably more new information but also for being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend
your spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship with all the book Tea in the East: Tea Habits
Along the Tea Route. You never experience lose out for everything if you read some books.

Beverly McKeever:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just
watching TV, as well as playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity here is
look different you can read any book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can
spent the whole day to reading a e-book. The book Tea in the East: Tea Habits Along the Tea Route it is
quite good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying
reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the e-book.
You can m0ore very easily to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this
book offers high quality.

Adam Mathews:

Tea in the East: Tea Habits Along the Tea Route can be one of your nice books that are good idea. We
recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge
in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The article author
giving his/her effort to place every word into joy arrangement in writing Tea in the East: Tea Habits Along
the Tea Route but doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm
resource data that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information could drawn you into brand
new stage of crucial contemplating.

Bonnie Parker:

This Tea in the East: Tea Habits Along the Tea Route is fresh way for you who has intense curiosity to look
for some information as it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you
know or you who still having little digest in reading this Tea in the East: Tea Habits Along the Tea Route can
be the light food in your case because the information inside this particular book is easy to get simply by
anyone. These books create itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book
form. People who think that in book form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there
is absolutely no in reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be



here for you. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and also knowledge.
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